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Client:
PPQ for Australian Amalgamated 
Terminals and Port of Brisbane

Project Location:
Port of Brisbane

Contract Value:
$1,100,000

Year completed:
2019

Scope:
Service Relocation
Stormwater Grate Install
Profiling
Asphalt
Concrete
Linemarking
Complex Traffic Control

AAT Resurfacing – Stage 1
Australian Amalgamated 

Terminals

ALL ENQUIRIES
Phone: +61 7 3807 9346
admin@civcorp.com.au
civcorp.com.au
3 Production Street 
Beenleigh  Qld  4207

Australian Amalgamated Terminals 
operates a large vehicle 
import/export terminal at the Port of 
Brisbane. The site required 
resurfacing, new linemarking, as well 
as stormwater and service pit 
upgrades.

Civcorp commenced works by 
replacing all pit lids and grates and 
ensuring site was ready for profiling. 
Profiling was completed on over 
16,000m2 of existing asphalt and 
profiled product sent for recycling.

Various asphaltic products were used 
depending on the planed use of the 
area. AC20H and AC14H products 
were used extensively as well as 
custom Portmix product. In total 
nearly 2200 tonnes were laid. Civcorp 
also liaised closely with AAT to ensure 
line marking was completed as per 
client expectations and optimised 
available space. 
Civcorp completed these works 
ensuring minimal disruption to port 
traffic including imported vehicle 
unloading and large container 
handlers and forklifts.
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